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Jorge Martínez, Partner at Axon Consulting, has over 10 year 
of international experience in consulting and operations in the 
ICT sector and has played a pivotal role in several advisory 
engagements in Europe, Americas, Middle East and Africa 
regions. 
Jorge has led during the last 10 years several engagements 
related to regulatory cost modelling for the European 
Commission1, a large number of NRAs and operators 
worldwide, having an extensive track record in the 
implementation of regulatory costing tools and operations 
profitability monitoring tools.  
Jorge has also advised international organisations, NRAs and 
governments in the development of policies and regulations 
associated to new technological developments. For instance, 
Jorge directed the study commissioned by the Body of 
European Regulators for Electronic Communications (BEREC) 
about the “Study on Implications of 5G Deployment on Future 
Business Models”2 and he managed the development of the 
Cloud Computing Regulatory Framework for Saudi Arabia3.  
Jorge holds an MSc in Telecommunication Engineering from the 
University of Zaragoza (Spain), graduating with Honours, and 
he received Telefonica’s Best Telecommunication Engineer 
Award (2010 class). Jorge speaks fluently Spanish and English. 

 

 

 
1 Results are published in EC’s webpage: https://ec.europa.eu/digital-single-market/en/news/finalisation-
mobile-cost-model-roaming-and-delegated-act-single-eu-wide-mobile-voice-call  
2 Published in BEREC’s webpage:  
https://berec.europa.eu/eng/document_register/subject_matter/berec/reports/8008-study-on-implications-of-
5g-deployment-on-future-business-models 
3 Published in NRA’s webpage:  
https://www.citc.gov.sa/en/RulesandSystems/RegulatoryDocuments/Pages/CCRF.aspx 
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